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To the best of the Architect’s knowledge, 
information and belief, the design of this project 
conforms to all applicable provisions of the New 
York State Uniform Fire Prevention and Building 
Code, the New York State Energy Conservation 
Construction Code, and the building standards 
of the New York State Education Department. It 
is a violation of the Education Law of the State of 
New York for any person to alter or modify this 
document in any way unless acting under the 
direction of a professional architect. BID SET 

The engineer that has signed this document 
certifies that to the best of their knowledge, 
information and belief, the asbestos plans and 
specifications are in accordance with applicable 
requirements of the New York State Uniform Fire 
Prevention and Building Code, Construction 
Standards of the Commissioner of Education, New 
York State Department of Labor Part 56 of Title 
12, and the United States Environmental Protection 
Agency Hazard Emergency Response ACT 
Regulations.  Anthony Meluso is accredited to the 
EPA and New York State under AHERA 
Regulations as an Asbestos Project Designer 
(Asbestos Handling Certificate Number 94-03914). 
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